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LETTER
PERSPECTIVE  
ON UPEI STRIKE

I was asked by my mechanic 
what the issues might be in 
the UPEI faculty strike. He 
knows that my spouse is a 
professor at UPEI. For a busy 
man, I wanted to give my 
friend an easy understanding 
of just one simple issue, that 
might give him perspective 
on some even broader issues 
here. Perhaps your readers 
might benefit likewise. 

SHORT CONTRACTS

My spouse has been a profes-
sor at UPEI for some 22 years. 
She is one of the more than 
50 per cent of professors who 
are contract workers. While 
some of these contracts are 
for up to one year, it would  
be safe to say that the major-
ity of these contracts are for a 
single three- or four-month 
term. 

These single-term contract 
instructors (professors) are 
called sessional instructors by 
the university, and it is their 
situation in particular that I 
wish to address. 

For sessional instructors 

you may read: part-time; no 
health-care benefit, no pen-
sion and limited job security. 
She is paid by the course that 
she teaches in any term and 
must apply for each one of 
them.

You may appreciate that 
every professor at a univer-
sity needs a minimum of two 
post-secondary degrees to 
teach there. For my spouse, 
after she had achieved an 
honours BA at UPEI, this had 
to include going off-Island for 

her master's degree for an ad-
ditional two years, as there is 
no MA program here in her 
discipline. Thus, the qualifica-
tions are indeed high.  

HEALTH BENEFITS

Consider this: as a long-
haul trucker, my employer 
provided health benefits 
to my family and covered 
half the cost. Public school 
teachers have such a ben-
efit; even school bus drivers 

have it. I do not diminish the 
importance of any of these 
professions, or the need for 
a health-care benefit in any 
of them. My point is simply 
that teachers at our higher 
learning institution, who 
have worked so hard to gain 
accreditation, and continue 
to work diligently to educate 
their students deserve at least 
the same consideration as 
these job descriptions. 

I recently retired from my 
profession, and with it, so 
went my family health ben-
efit. 

I can tell your readers, in 
case they haven’t had the 
pleasure, that procuring a 
health benefit on one’s own 

is a costly business, with 
lesser available benefits than 
a group plan. Of course, 
providers of extended health 
benefits — the insurers —  
can give a reduced price  
and better benefits to institu-
tions like employers or uni-
versities, where they bundle  
a number of applicants. 
Would it not make sense, 
then, for the university to 
provide such coverage to all 
its professors? 

While the university does 
offer its sessional instructors 
a small stipend to help offset 
health costs, it does not come 
close to covering the cost of 
the coverage. It seems reason-
able to me that the university 
should be providing such cov-
erage, where they already do 
provide it for the other half of 
their teachers and can get it 
at a cost far less than what an 
individual can pay. 

Would this not be the least 
the university could do for 
its dedicated professors? And 
that is my perspective, and I 
hope, a useful one in this con-
versation. 
Ian Dennison,
Victoria, P.E.I.

Every professor at a university needs a minimum of two post-
secondary degrees to teach there, whether they are tenured 
employees or contract workers.  
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For sessional 
instructors you 
may read: part-
time; no health-
care benefit, 
no pension 
and limited job 
security. 

LEARNING

Education in P.E.I. election
Whatever happened to education accountability on the Island? 

PAUL W. BENNETT
COMMENTARY

Public accountability is a frail 
flower in school systems and, 
particularly so, on Prince 
Edward Island. Since the 
election of the Dennis King 
Progressive Conservative 
government in April 2019, 
it has become virtually an 
endangered plant species. 
Education policy has been 
reduced to “investments in 
youth,” school trustee elec-
tions were completely bun-
gled, and provincial student 
assessments allowed to perish. 

No one, aside from a band 
of regionally-elected trust-
ees and the P.E.I. home and 
school executive have much 
of a clue what’s going on 
in the K-12 school system. 
Most on the Island remain in 
the dark about the collateral 
damage inflicted by COVID-
19 school shutdowns. It’s 
now next to impossible to 
track system performance 
or student success affecting 
some 21,000 students in the 
province’s 62 schools. For 
the most part, the April 2023 
election will leave them none 
the wiser. 

EMPTY PLATFORMS
Provincial party platforms, 
taken together, focus almost 
exclusively on spending fed-
eral dollars for early learning 
centres and staffing-up in 
human resources across the 
board hiring more early child-
hood educators, teachers and 
educational assistants. 

A new junior high school 
for Stratford is presented as 
a gift from the governing 
party. The once-mighty Lib-
erals offer mighty thin gruel. 
Only the Green party seems 
attuned to the pandemic im-
pact with pledges to improve 
school air quality and provide 
access to vaccinations in 
schools.   

LOCAL VOICES
The long-awaited November 
2022 school trustee elections 
were an unmitigated disas-
ter, if you believe in revital-
izing school-level education 
democracy. Electing seven 
trustees across the entire 
English public schools sector 
smacks of tokenism and those 
elected represent “zones” so 
large that it conspires to limit 
their effectiveness. It’s virtu-
ally impossible, covering large 

territories and working part-
time, to provide responsive 
democratic representation. 

A new provincial board 
of trustees assumed office, 
elected by a tiny segment 
of eligible electors. Holding 
stand-alone school trustee 
elections was a serious error 
in judgment, as amply illus-
trated elsewhere. Over the 
entire English public schools 
sector, one of the seven trust-
ees was acclaimed and, over 
the remaining six zones, only 
a total of 841 mail-in ballots 
were actually cast. 

P.E.I. education voter reg-
istration hurdles rivalled that 
in the American South during 
the civil rights battles of the 
1960s. Only 3.5 per cent of 
eligible voters registered for 
mail-in ballots under a cum-
bersome, difficult to access, 
voter registration system. 

STUDENT ASSESSMENTS   

Since the disastrous 2003 
round of PISA testing, when 
Island students trailed stu-
dents elsewhere in reading, 
mathematics and science, 
P.E.I. was a genuine national 
success story. Low achieve-
ment in PISA continued in 
2006, 2009 and in 2012, then 
came the turnaround. Ten 
years ago, P.E.I. students 
performed below the OECD 
median.

Working behind the 

scenes, P.E.I. education lead-
ers and educators developed 
students with stronger foun-
dational skills capable of 
higher levels of performance. 
A provincial assessment unit 
was established in 2007 and 
a series of tests developed, 
beginning with Grade 9 math 
and then Grade 3 reading in 
2010. A full slate of provincial 
assessments was administered 
from 2012 to 2019. Island stu-
dents made significant gains 
and were the most improved 
in the entire country. Teach-
ers and staff used the data to 
set goals, plan interventions 
and bring precision to teach-
ing until its demise.

Student assessments were 
an issue in the April 2019 
election and shortly after the 
King PCs were elected, the 
Provincial Assessment Pro-
gram was phased out and the 
provincial unit dismantled. 
No provincial review of the 
cancelled program was ever 
released and the assessment-
focused PD for teachers 
simply disappeared. Teacher 
unions are never big fans of 
student testing and the ap-
pointment of a former PEITF 
president as deputy education 
minister may have sealed its 
fate. 

The provincial policy 
initiative that put P.E.I. on 
top simply evaporated a few 
months before COVID hit in 
March of 2020. There was no 

official announcement and it 
escaped public notice, possi-
bly because of the suspension 
of assessments during the 
worst of the pandemic. Now, 
with province after province 
releasing post-pandemic test 
scores, the Island is vulner-
able and flying blind without 
access to comprehensive stu-
dent assessment results.  

P.E.I. student test results 
are now either released for 
selected cohorts of students 
or delayed in their release. In 
July of 2021, a limited Pro-
gram Evaluation for Grade 3 
reading (based upon a small 
sample of students) was re-
leased, aimed at allaying pub-
lic fears of pandemic learning 
loss. (CBC July 14, 2021). On 
the 2019 PCAP test, Grade 
3 reading results were low 
and the preliminary data for 
2021 looked similar. Results 
of other program evaluation 
tests for mathematics were 
supposed to be forthcoming 
in the fall of 2022 but failed to 
appear. 

CONFRONTING  
THE FUTURE

The April 2023 provincial 
election was a missed oppor-
tunity to confront the largely 
hidden or concealed issues in 
P.E.I. education. So far, the 
elected provincial trustees 
look to be learning the ropes 
and a long way from being 

in a position to give voice to 
public concerns or proposed 
constructive reforms. 

Hamstrung by a rather 
constrained and managed 
governance role, the fledgling 
trustees lack the authority to 
advance structural reform. It 
will take a new government 
to fix the trustee election 
process and build-out repre-
sentation and engage school 
communities. In the absence 
of effective elected trustees 
and without a robust parent 
advocacy group, the P.E.I. 
Home and School Associa-
tion may step into the breech. 
Two proposed 2023 PEIH&S 
resolutions, on “Streamlining 
school board elections” and 
“Reading literacy,” provide 
fine fodder for needed educa-
tional reforms.  

Education deserves to be 
a much higher priority. It’s a 
shame that the ruling party 
and the opposition are mostly 
consumed by “investing” 
more in the system. It may 
take an “education crisis” or 
shocking student test scores 
to wake them up on the edu-
cation front. 

Paul W.  Bennett, Ed.D., is 
director, Schoolhouse Institute, 
and adjunct professor of 
education, Saint Mary’s 
University. His latest book is 
"The State of the System: A 
Reality Check on Canada’s 
Schools (2020). " 

Student assessments were an issue in the April 2019 election and shortly after the King PCs were elected, the Provincial As-
sessment Program was phased out and the provincial unit dismantled without any public review of the program or announce-
ment it was ending. FILE
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